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1.   Citation 
   This Order may be cited as the Declaration of Controlled Hunting Areas Order. 

2.   Declaration of controlled hunting areas 
   Each area described in the Schedule hereto is hereby declared to be a controlled hunting area 
for the purposes of the Act. 

SCHEDULE 
CONTROLLED HUNTING AREAS 

KACHIKAU CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 1) 

   Commencing at a point on the international boundary between Botswana and the Caprivi Zipfel 
being a point on the Chobe National Park boundary (as defined in the Wildlife Conservation and 

National Parks Act due north of a beacon situated on Fire-break No. 19 at Ngoma, the boundary 
runs due south to the said beacon; thence southwards following the eastern edge of the said 
Fire-break No. 19 for a distance of approximately twenty and one half miles; thence due west to 
the international boundary between Botswana and the Caprivi Zipfel being a point on the Chobe 
River; thence generally north-eastwards following the said international boundary to the point of 
commencement. 

KASANE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 2) 

   Commencing at a point on the eastern boundary of the Chobe National Park being the 
intersection of the said boundary and the direct road from Serondela to Lesoma, the boundary 
runs generally eastwards following the middle of the said Lesoma road to its intersection with the 
international boundary between Botswana and Zimbabwe at the Lesoma Gate; thence generally 
south-eastwards following the said international boundary between Botswana and Zimbabwe to 
the middle of the gate on the road from Kanyu to Matetsi in Zimbabwe at Pandamatenga; thence 
generally south-westwards following the middle of the said road from Matetsi to Kanyu to its 
intersection with the road from Dodo to Masame at Dodo; thence generally westwards following 
the middle of the said road from Dodo to Masame to the borehole at Masame; thence in a 
straight line due west to the eastern boundary of the Chobe National Park; thence generally 
northwards following the eastern boundary of the Chobe National Park to the point of 
commencement. 

MASAME CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 3) 
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   Commencing at the junction of the Kanyu to Pandamatenga and Nunga to Ngwezumba roads, 
the boundary runs generally westwards following the middle of the Nunga to Nwezumba road for 
a distance of approximately four miles to the intersection of this road and the road from 
Pandamatenga to Masame, thence generally westwards following the middle of the 
Pandamatenga to Masame Road to the borehole at Masame; thence due west to the eastern 
boundary of the Chobe National Park; thence generally southwards and westwards to a point on 
latitude 19° south being exactly twelve miles due west of the stock-route from Bushman Pits to 
Kazungula; thence in a straight line due south to the point where this line is intersected by the 
straight line drawn between the junction of the old road from Maun to Joverega and the eastern 
boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory and the north-east beacon of the Marulamantsi Ranch 
boundary; thence eastwards following the latter line for about one mile to its intersection with the 
middle of the road from Kanyu to Pandamatenga; thence generally north-eastwards following the 
said road from Kanyu to Pandamatenga to the point of commencement. 

TAMAFUPA CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 4) 

   Commencing at a point on the international boundary between Botswana and Zimbabwe being 
a point in the middle of the gate at Pandamatenga on the road from Kanyu to Matetse (in 
Zimbabwe) the boundary runs generally south-westwards following the middle of the said road 
from Matetse to Kanyu to the point where it is intersected by the straight line drawn between the 
junction of the old road from Maun to Joverega where it intersects the eastern boundary of the 
Batawana Tribal Territory and the north-eastern beacon of Marulamantsi Ranch; thence 
eastwards following the latter said line to the said beacon at Marulamantsi Ranch; thence 
southwards following the eastern boundary of Marulamantsi Ranch to a point three miles distant 
from the said beacon; thence due east to a point on the international boundary between 
Botswana and Zimbabwe; thence generally north-westwards following the international boundary 
to the point of commencement. 

KWANDO CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 5) 

   Commencing at the point of intersection of the middle of the Okavango River and the 
international boundary between Botswana and the Caprivi Zipfel, the boundary runs north-
eastwards and south-eastwards following the said international boundary to the point where the 
west bank of the Chobe River makes its most northern contact with the international boundary 
between Botswana and the Caprivi Zipfel approximately five miles north of Jame's Camp and 
approximately twenty miles north of the junction of the Selinda and the Chobe Rivers; thence in a 
straight line south-westwards to Gwilingwa; thence due south to the southern bank of the 
Selinda; thence generally southwards following the eastern and southern bank of the Selinda to 
its confluence with the Ng-gokha River; thence due south to the middle of the Ng-gokha River; 
thence generally westwards and north-westwards following the middle of the Ng-gokha River to 
its confluence with the Okavango River; and thence following the middle of the Okavango River 
north-westwards to the point of commencement. 

SAVUTI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 6) 

   Commencing at the intersection of the international boundary between Botswana and the 
Caprivi Zipfel and the eastern boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory, the boundary runs 
southwards following the said Tribal boundary for a distance of about thirty-four miles to the point 
where the boundary is intersected by the middle of the Tsetse Control track which runs from 
Tsantsara westwards on an approximate bearing of 283° (true north) to an island in the eastern 
extension of the Selinda; thence continuing on this bearing to the point of intersection of this 
bearing and a straight line drawn from Gwilingwa to the point on the international boundary 
where the Chobe River first touches the northern boundary of Botswana, being a point about five 
miles north of Jame's Camp and about twenty miles north of the junction of the Chobe and 
Selinda Rivers; thence north-eastwards following the said line to the said point on the 
international boundary between Botswana and the Caprivi Zipfel; thence generally south-
eastwards, southwards and north-eastwards following the said international boundary to the point 
of commencement. 

KHWAI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 7) 



   Commencing at a point on the eastern boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory being the 
point of intersection of the said boundary with the middle of the Tsetse Control track which runs 
from Tsantsara westwards on an approximate bearing of 283° (true north) to an island in the 
eastern extension of the Selinda, the boundary follows the middle of the said Tsetse Control 
track westwards, and its extension on a bearing of 283° (true north) to the point where this 
extension meets a straight line drawn from a point on the northern boundary of Botswana five 
miles north of Jame's Camp and approximately twenty miles north of the junction of the Selinda 
and Chobe Rivers to Gwilingwa; thence in a straight line south-westwards to Gwilingwa; thence 
due south to the south-eastern bank of the Selinda; thence generally southwards following the 
south-eastern bank of the Selinda to its junction with the Ng-gokha River; thence due south to 
the middle of the Ng-gokha River; thence generally eastwards following the middle of the Ng-
gokha River until it becomes the Moanachira River; thence generally eastwards following the 
middle of the Moanachira River until it becomes the Khwai River; thence generally eastwards 
following the middle of the Khwai River to the point where it is intersected by the eastern 
boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory at a point about eight miles north-west of Kudumane; 
thence due north following the said Tribal boundary to the point of commencement. 

MABABE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 8) 

   Commencing at a beacon situated on the southern edge of a molapo known as Tsantsara (also 
known as Gatgarra) being a point on the eastern boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory, the 
boundary runs in a south-easterly direction following the southern edge of the Tsantsara Molapo 
to its intersection with the western edge of the sand ridge known as Magwikwe; thence generally 
southwards following the western edge of the Magwikwe Sand Ridge to its point of intersection 
with Latitude 19° south; thence eastwards following the said Latitude 19° to a point on the said 
Latitude 19° south twelve miles due east of the stock-route from Bushman Pits to Kazungula; 
thence in a straight line due south to its point of intersection with a straight line drawn between 
the beacon at the north-east corner of Marulamantsi Ranch and the point where the old road 
from Maun to Joverega intersects the eastern boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory; thence 
eastwards in a straight line to the said point of intersection of the old road from Maun to Joverega 
and the eastern boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory; thence due north following the Tribal 
boundary to the point of commencement. 

MATSEBE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 9) 

   Commencing at a point in the middle of the Thaoge River twenty miles north-east of the kgotla 
in Gomare, the boundary runs generally southwards following the middle of the Thaoge River to 
a point south-east of Tsau where it is intersected by the middle of the Tsetse Fly Control track 
from Toteng to Tsau; thence following the middle of the said track eastwards to the point where it 
intersects the cut line of the outer Tsetse Control fence approximately six miles north of Toteng 
Bridge; thence north-eastwards, north-westwards and north-eastwards following the said cut line 
and the Tsetse Control Fence to the point where it intersects the eastern bank of the Xudum 
River; thence generally north-westwards following the eastern bank of the Xudum River to the 
point where the Xudum River enters Qo Lagoon; thence in a straight line north-westwards to the 
point of commencement. 

BOTETI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 10) 

Sub-division One 
   Commencing at the point where the eastern boundary of the Makgadikgadi Pans Game 
Reserve meets the new Maun to Nata road, the boundary runs eastwards, following the middle of 
the said road, to the point where it is intersected by the western boundary of the Bamangwato 
Tribal Territory (marked Bamangwato Reserve on some maps); thence southwards and 
eastwards following the said Tribal boundary to the point where it meets the northern edge of the 
Makgadikgadi Pan; thence generally westwards and southwards following the northern and 
western edge of the Makgadikgadi Pan to the point where the edge of the said Pan is intersected 
by the eastern boundary of the Makgadikgadi Pans Game Reserve; thence due north, following 
the Reserve boundary, to the point of commencement. 

Sub-division Two 



   Commencing at the point where the eastern bank of the Boteti River enters Lake Xau, the 
boundary runs westwards and northwards, following the eastern bank of the said river to the 
point where it meets the boundary of the Makgadikgadi Pans Game Reserve; thence eastwards, 
southwards and north-eastwards to the point where the boundary of the said Game Reserve 
intersects the western edge of the Makgadikgadi Pan; thence southwards and south-eastwards 
following the edge of the said Pan to the point where the western bank of the molapo running 
from the north-eastern corner of Lake Xau to Makgadikgadi meets the edge of the said Pan; 
thence south-westwards following the western bank of the said molapo to the point where it 
enters Lake Xau; thence westwards following the northern edge of Lake Xau to the point of 
commencement. The above sub-divisions are shown more fully on Plan 00-2 deposited with the 
Department of Surveys and Lands, Gaborone. 

RAKOPS CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 11) 

   Commencing at the point of intersection of the middle of the Boteti River and the western 
boundary of the Bamangwato Tribal Territory the boundary runs down the middle of the Boteti 
River generally eastwards and southwards to the point where the said river enters Lake Dow; 
thence following the western, southern and eastern shore of Lake Dow to the point where the 
said river emerges; thence north-eastwards following the southern bank of the river to the point 
where it enters Makgadikgadi Pan; thence generally northwards, south-eastwards and eastwards 
following the southern edge of the Makgadikgadi Pan to the point where it adjoins Sua Pan; 
thence generally south-eastwards following the southern edge of Sua Pan to the intersection of 
the Pan edge and the Dukwe/Mokoba Fence; thence generally south-westwards following the 
prolongation of the Dukwe/Mokoba Fence to its intersection with the south-western boundary of 
the Bamangwato Tribal Territory; thence north-westwards and northwards following the said 
Bamangwato Tribal Territory boundary to the point of commencement. 

SHASHE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 12) 

   Commencing on the southern bank of the Shashe River where it is intersected by the middle of 
the road from Palapye to Francistown at Tonota the boundary runs generally south-eastwards 
following the southern bank of the Shashe River to its intersection with the western end of the 
boundary of the Tuli Circle; thence following the boundary of the Tuli Circle generally south-
westwards to its intersection with the back-line fence of the Tuli Block; thence generally 
southwards following the back-line fence of the Tuli Block to the point where it is intersected by 
the middle of the Motloutse River; thence generally westwards following the middle of the 
Motloutse River to the point where it is intersected by the road from Palapye to Francistown near 
Foley Siding; thence generally northwards following the middle of the road from Palapye to 
Francistown to the point of commencement. 

WESTERN KGALAGADI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 13) 

   Commencing at the junction of the northern boundary of the Kgalagadi District and the 
international boundary between Botswana and Namibia, the boundary runs eastwards to the 
point where it is intersected by the middle of the road from Thakatshwane to Tshane to 
Tshabong; thence southwards following the middle of the said road from Thakatshwane to 
Tshane to Tshabong to the point where it is intersected by the parallel of south latitude which 
passes through Werda Village; thence westwards to the point where the said parallel of south 
latitude is intersected by a line drawn from Latitude 25° 30' south, Longitude 21° 30' east to the 
intersection of Latitude 24° 21' 37" south with the international boundary between Botswana and 
Namibia; thence north-westwards following the said line to its point of intersection with the 
international boundary between Botswana and Namibia; thence due north following the 
international boundary to the point of commencement. 

EASTERN KGALAGADI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 14) 

   Commencing at the point on the northern boundary of the Kgalagadi District being the 
intersection of the said boundary with the middle of the road from Thakatshwane to Tshane to 
Tshabong the boundary runs eastwards along the said northern boundary to the north-eastern 
corner of the Kgalagadi District; thence southwards along the eastern boundary of the Kgalagadi 



District to the intersection of the prolongation of the eastern boundary with the parallel of latitude 
passing through Werda Village; thence westwards along the said parallel of latitude to its 
intersection with the middle of the said road from Thakatshwane to Tshane to Tshabong; thence 
generally northwards along the middle of the said road to the point of commencement. 

SEPOPA CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 15) 

   Commencing at a point on the international boundary between Botswana and the Caprivi Zipfel 
being the intersection of the said boundary with the middle of the Okavango River, the boundary 
runs generally south-eastwards following the middle of the Okavango River to the point where it 
becomes the Thaoge River; thence following the middle of the Thaoge River generally 
southwards to the point where it is intersected by the parallel of south latitude 19° 45'; thence 
due west following the said parallel of south latitude to its intersection with the international 
boundary between Botswana and Namibia; thence due north following the said international 
boundary to its intersection with the international boundary between Botswana and the Caprivi 
Zipfel; thence eastwards following the latter international boundary between Botswana and the 
Caprivi Zipfel to the point of commencement. 

KUKI WEST CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 16) 

   Commencing at a point in the middle of the Thaoge River being the point of intersection of the 
said river and parallel of south latitude 19° 45', the boundary runs generally southwards following 
the middle of the Thaoge River to the point where it is intersected by the middle of the Tsetse 
Control track from Tsau to Toteng south-west of Tsau; thence generally eastwards following the 
middle of the said track to the point where it is intersected by the cut line of the outer Tsetse 
Control Fence six miles north-west of Toteng Bridge; thence in a straight line to the middle of the 
Toteng Bridge; thence generally westwards following the main road from Maun to Ghanzi 
through Sehitwa and the Dautsa Flats west of Lake Ngami to the middle of the Kuki Gate; thence 
due west following the Kuki Fence to its intersection with the international boundary between 
Botswana and Namibia; thence due north following the said international boundary to its 
intersection with the parallel of south latitude 19° 45'; thence due east to the point of 
commencement. 

JAO CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 17) 

   Commencing in the middle of Dobe Lagoon, the boundary runs due south to the northern bank 
of Chief's Island; thence generally north-westwards, westwards and south-eastwards following 
round the bank of Chief's Island to a point on the south-western bank due east of the middle of 
Qo Lagoon; thence due west to the middle of Qo Lagoon; thence north-westwards in a straight 
line to a point in the middle of the Thaoge River twenty miles north-east of the kgotla in Gomare; 
thence generally northwards following the middle of the Thaoge River to the point of its 
divergence with the Ng-gokha River; thence generally eastwards following the middle of the Ng-
gokha River to the middle of the Dobe Lagoon being the point of commencement. 

SANTANTADIBE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 18) 

   Commencing at a point on the north bank of Chief's Island due south of the middle of Dobe 
Lagoon, the boundary runs due north to the middle of Dobe Lagoon; thence following the middle 
of the Moanachira River generally eastwards to the point where it impinges on the north-western 
corner of the boundary of the Moremi Wildlife Reserve; thence following the western boundary of 
the Moremi Wildlife Reserve south-eastwards to the point where it intersects the Gomoti River; 
thence generally westwards following the middle of the western source of the Gomoti River to its 
point of divergence with the Santantadibe River being a point on the northern bank of Chief's 
Island; thence generally north-westwards following the northern bank of Chief's Island to the 
point of commencement. 

MAQWEE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 19) 

   Commencing at a point on the eastern boundary of the Moremi Wildlife Reserve being its 
intersection with the parallel of south latitude 19° 21'; the boundary runs due east following the 
said parallel of south latitude to its intersection with the northern extension of the Mogogelo 



River; thence generally southwards, south-westwards, westwards and north-westwards following 
the said Mogogelo River to its point of intersection with the eastern boundary of the Moremi 
Wildlife Reserve to the point of commencement. 

CHITABE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 20) 

   Commencing at the confluence of the Santantadibe and Thamalagane Rivers, the boundary 
runs generally north-westwards following the western bank of the Santantadibe River to the point 
of confluence of the western source of the Gomoti River and the Santantadibe River; thence 
generally eastwards following the southern bank of the western source of the Gomoti River to the 
point where the Gomoti River is intersected by the western boundary of the Moremi Wildlife 
Reserve; thence south-eastwards following the western boundary of the Moremi Wildlife Reserve 
to its most southern intersection with the middle of the Mogogelo River; thence generally south-
eastwards following the middle of the Mogogelo River to its confluence with the northern 
extension of the Thamalagane River; thence generally southwards following the western bank of 
the Thamalagane River to its point of commencement. 

KHURUNXARAGA CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 21) 

   Commencing at a point on the western bank of Chief's Island due east of the middle of the Qo 
Lagoon, the boundary runs generally south-eastwards following the western bank of Chief's 
Island to the point where the Boro River diverges from the said bank of Chief's Island; thence 
due south to the middle of the Boro River; thence generally southwards following the middle of 
the Boro River to the point where it is intersected by the outer Tsetse Control Fence about nine 
and one half miles north of Maun; thence generally south-westwards following the said outer 
Tsetse Control Fence to its junction with the middle of the Khwapa River; thence north-
westwards following the middle of the Khwapa River to its point of divergence with the Xudum 
River; thence following the middle of the Xudum River generally northwards to the point of 
commencement. 

KUKI EAST CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 22) 

   Commencing at the intersection of the road from Maun to Kuki Gate which passes through the 
Dautsa Flats and to the west of Lake Ngami, and the road from Mathamagana to Motlhatlhogo, 
the boundary runs generally eastwards and south of Lake Ngami following the middle of the latter 
road through Bodibeng Village to the kgotla at Motlhatlhogo; thence following the straight line 
drawn from Motlhatlhogo kgotla to Toteng Bridge to the point where this line is intersected by the 
southern bank of the Nxhabe River; thence generally north-eastwards following the southern 
bank of the Nxhabe River to its confluence with the Boteti River; thence following the southern 
bank of the Boteti River generally eastwards to its point of intersection with the Makalamabedi 
Fence; thence due south following the Makalamabedi Fence to its point of intersection with the 
Kuki Fence; thence due westwards following the Kuki Fence to its point of intersection with the 
main road from Maun to Ghanzi at Kuki Gate; thence generally northwards following the Maun to 
Ghanzi road to the point of commencement. 

LAKE NGAMI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 23) 

   Commencing at a point on the Toteng Bridge where the main road from Maun to Sehitwa 
intersects the middle of the Matsebe River, the boundary runs southwards in a straight line to the 
Kgotla in Motlhatlhogo Village; thence generally westwards following the road from Motlhatlhogo 
to Mathamagana via Bodibeng and the southern shore of Lake Ngami to the intersection of this 
road and the main road from Maun to Kuki via Sehitwa; thence following the middle of the latter 
road from Maun to Kuki generally eastwards to the point of commencement. 

MAKALAMABEDI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 24) 

   Commencing at the point where the Makalamabedi Fence intersects the middle of the old road 
from Bushman Pits to Maun, the boundary runs northwards following the fence line to the point 
where it is intersected by the middle of the old road from Maun to Joverega about four miles east 
of Rakoko; thence eastwards following a straight line drawn between this point and the most 
north-eastern beacon on Marulamantsi Ranch to the point where this line intersects the middle of 



the new stock-route from Bushman Pits to Kazungula; thence generally south-westwards 
following the middle of the said stock-route to its intersection with the old road from Kanyu to 
Maun; thence generally westwards following the middle of the said road from Kanyu to Maun via 
Bushman Pits to the point of commencement. 

ODEAKWE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 25) 

   Commencing at a point where the eastern boundary of Ngamiland District is intersected by a 
straight line drawn between the point of intersection of the old road from Maun to Joverega and 
the eastern boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory about four miles east of Rakoko and the 
north-eastern boundary beacon of Marulamantsi Ranch, the boundary runs eastwards following 
the said straight line to the intersection of the said straight line and the western boundary fence 
of Mahutumabe Ranch; thence south-westwards following the western boundary fence of 
Mahutumabe Ranch to the most south-westerly beacon of the said ranch being a point on the 
northern edge of the old road from Nata to Bushman Pits; thence westwards following the 
northern edge of the old road from Nata to Bushman Pits to the point where it is intersected by 
the eastern boundary of Ngamiland District; thence northwards, north-westwards and northwards 
following the eastern boundary of Ngamiland District to the point of commencement. 

NATA CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 26) 

   Commencing at a point on the eastern boundary of Marulamantsi Ranch; the said point being 
exactly three miles south of the north-eastern boundary beacon of the said Marulamantsi Ranch 
being measured along the said eastern boundary, the boundary runs due east to the point where 
it intersects the international boundary between Botswana and Zimbabwe; thence generally 
south-eastwards following the said international boundary to the point where it is intersected by 
the middle of the Nata River; thence generally south-westwards following the middle of the Nata 
River to the point where it is intersected by the old motor bridge at Nata; thence following the 
middle of the old road from Francistown to Bushman Pits to a point in the middle of the said road 
due south of the most south-easterly boundary beacon of Marulamantsi Ranch; thence due north 
to the said boundary beacon of Marulamantsi Ranch; thence following the eastern boundary of 
Marulamantsi Ranch northwards to the point of commencement. 

SUA PAN CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 27) 

   Commencing at a point on the international boundary between Botswana and Zimbabwe being 
the point of intersection of the said boundary and the middle of the Nata River, the boundary runs 
generally south-eastwards following the said international boundary to the point of intersection of 
the said boundary and the Dukwe Fence; thence south-westwards following the said Dukwe 
Fence to the point where it intersects the eastern bank of Sua Pan; thence generally northwards, 
north-westwards and southwards following the edge of the Sua Pan to the point where it joins the 
Makgadikgadi Pan; thence generally northwards following the eastern edge of the Makgadikgadi 
Pan to the point where it is intersected by the old road from Nata to Maun; thence generally 
south-eastwards following the old road from Nata to Maun to the middle of the bridge over the 
Nata River at Nata; thence generally north-eastwards following the middle of the Nata River to 
the point of commencement. 

LEBUNG CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 28) 

   Commencing at a point in the middle of the Gate in the Makoba Fence where it is intersected 
by the road from Serowe to Rakops, the boundary runs generally southwards and south-
eastwards following the middle of the old road from Makoba to Serowe which passes just north of 
Moijabana to a point in the middle of the said road due north of Moijabana; thence south-
eastwards in a straight line to a point in the middle of the old road from Serowe to Mahalapye ten 
miles from Serowe; thence generally southwards following the old road which travels direct from 
Serowe to Mahalapye to the Mahalapye/Palapye road junction; thence southwards following the 
middle of the main road from Mahalapye to Dibete to the point where it is intersected by the 
molapo known as Serorome about seven miles south of Palla Road Siding; thence generally 
westwards following the middle of the Serorome Molapo to the point where it is intersected by the 
Dibete Fence; thence generally north-westwards through Lephephe Village following the Dibete 



Fence to the point where it is intersected by the western extension of the Dukwe Fence; thence 
north-eastwards following the Makoba Fence line to the point of commencement. 

OKWA CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 29) 

   Commencing at a point in the middle of the Mamono Gate on the international boundary 
between Botswana and Namibia the boundary runs eastwards along the middle of the road from 
Mamono-Ghanzi to a point in the middle of the said road due south of the south-western beacon 
of the Xanagas farms; thence due north to the said beacon; thence generally eastwards and 
northwards following the southern and eastern boundaries of the Xanagas farms to the north-
eastern beacon of the said Xanagas farms; thence due north to a point on the international 
boundary between Botswana and Namibia; thence eastwards to the south-western beacon of the 
Ghanzi farms; thence generally eastwards along the southern boundary of the Ghanzi farms to 
the intersection of this boundary with the middle of the road from Ghanzi to Kang; thence south-
eastwards following the middle of the road from Ghanzi to Kang to the point where it is 
intersected by the southern boundary of the Ghanzi District; thence due west to the international 
boundary following the southern boundary of the Ghanzi District; thence due north following the 
international boundary to the point of commencement. 

ANDERSSEN'S VLEI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 30) 

   Commencing at the point on the southern boundary of the Ghanzi farms where it is intersected 
by the middle of the road from Ghanzi to Kang, the boundary runs eastwards and northwards 
following the boundary of the Ghanzi farms to the point where it is intersected by the road from 
Dekar to Xade Pan; thence generally south-eastwards following the middle of the road from 
Dekar to Xade Pan to the point where it is intersected by the western boundary of the Central 
Kgalagadi Game Reserve; thence due south following the western boundary of the Kgalagadi 
Game Reserve to its junction with the southern boundary of the Ghanzi District; thence due west 
following the southern boundary of Ghanzi District to the point where it is intersected by the 
middle of the road from Kang to Ghanzi; thence generally north-westwards following the middle 
of the road from Kang to Ghanzi to the point of commencement. 

WESTERN KWENENG CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 31) 

   The boundary of which commencing at the intersection of the middle of the road from Sekhoma 
Pan through Dutle to the Central Kgalagadi Game Reserve with the southern boundary of the 
Bakwena Tribal Territory runs north-westwards northwards and eastwards along the said 
Bakwena Tribal Territory boundary to its intersection with the middle of the said road from 
Sekhoma Pan through Dutle to the Central Kgalagadi Game Reserve; thence generally 
southwards along the middle of the said road to the point of commencement. 

MIDDLE KWENENG CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 32) 

   The boundary of which commencing at a point on the southern boundary of the Bakwena Tribal 
Territory due south of the southwestern corner of the Botswana Police Camp fence at Letlhakeng 
runs north-westwards along the said southern boundary to its intersection with the middle of the 
road from Sekhoma Pan through Dutle to the Central Kgalagadi Game Reserve; thence 
generally northwards along the middle of the said road to its intersection with the northern 
boundary of the Bakwena Tribal Territory; thence eastwards along the said northern boundary to 
its intersection with the middle of the road from Letlhakeng to the Metsi-amanong; thence 
generally southwards along the middle of the said road to its intersection with the production of 
the line of the western boundary fence of the Botswana Police Camp at Letlhakeng; thence 
southwards along the boundary fence of the said Camp to the southwestern corner of the said 
fence; thence due south to the point of commencement. 

EASTERN KWENENG CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 33) 

   The boundary of which commencing at a point on the southern boundary of the Bakwena Tribal 
Territory due south of the south-western corner of the Botswana Police Camp fence; Letlhakeng 
runs due north to the said fence corner of the said Camp; thence northwards along the said 
boundary fence to a point on the production of the fence line in the middle of the road from 



Letlhakeng to Metsi-amanong; thence generally northwards along the middle of the said road to 
its intersection with the northern boundary of the Bakwena Tribal Territory; thence eastwards 
generally southwards and northwestwards along the Bakwena Tribal Territory boundary to the 
point of commencement. 

TSHABONG CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 34) 

   Commencing at the intersection of the parallel of south latitude which passes through Werda 
Village and a line drawn from Longitude 21° 30' east, Latitude 25° 30' south to Latitude 24° 21' 
37" south, Longitude 20° 00' east, the boundary runs eastwards to the Police Camp at Werda; 
thence due south to the international boundary between Botswana and South Africa; thence 
generally south-westwards, westwards and northwards following the said international boundary 
to the southern boundary of the Gemsbok National Park at Twee Rivieren; thence due east to 
Longitude 21° 30' east; thence northwards along Longitude 21° 30' east to its intersection with 
Latitude 25° 30' south; thence north-westwards in a straight line to the point of commencement. 

CHIEF'S ISLAND CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 35) 

   Commencing at the point of confluence of the Boro and Thamalagane Rivers, the boundary 
runs generally north-westwards following the western bank of the Thamalagane River to its 
confluence with the Santantadibe River, thence following the western bank of the Santantadibe 
River generally north-westwards to a point approximately one mile west of the divergences of the 
Santantadibe River and the Boroka River, being a point on the north bank of Chief's Island; 
thence generally northwards, westwards and south-westwards following the periphery of Chief's 
Island to the point where the Boro River impinges on the south bank of Chief's Island about five 
miles north-east of the northern tip of Bokwe Island; thence following the northern bank of the 
Boro River generally south-eastwards to the point of commencement. 

MOREMI CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 36) 

   Commencing at Beacon "A" of the Moremi Wildlife Reserve the boundary follows the middle of 
the Khwai River generally in an easterly direction to its point of intersection with the eastern 
boundary of the Batawana Tribal Territory boundary at a point about eight miles northwest of 
Kudumane Village; thence due south following the said tribal boundary to its point of intersection 
with the parallel of south latitude 19° 20'; thence westwards following the said parallel of south 
latitude to its intersection with the eastern boundary of the Moremi Wildlife Reserve; thence 
northwards following the said eastern boundary of the Moremi Wildlife Reserve to the point of 
commencement. 

MEA CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 37) 

   Commencing at a point in the middle of the gate in the Makoba Cordon Fence where the fence 
is intersected by the road from Serowe to Rakops, the boundary runs generally north-eastwards 
following the Makoba Fence to a point in the middle of the gate at Ntane being a point in the 
middle of the direct road from Mosu to Serule via Tlalamabele; thence following the middle of the 
said road from Mosu to Serule generally south-eastwards via Tlalamebele to its junction with the 
middle of the main road from Francistown to Mahalapye at Serule Siding; thence generally 
southwards following the middle of the main road from Francistown to Mahalapye to a point 
approximately three miles south of Palapye being the junction of the Francistown to Mahalapye 
road and the main road to Rakops via Makoba; thence following the middle of the 
Rakops/Makoba main road via Serowe generally north-westwards to the point of 
commencement. 

DUKWE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 38) 

   Commencing at a point in the middle of the Ntane gate in the Makoba Cordon Fence, the 
boundary runs northwards and north-eastwards following the said Cordon Fence through Dukwe 
to its junction with the international boundary between Botswana and Zimbabwe at Maitengwe; 
thence generally eastwards and south-eastwards following the said international boundary to its 
junction with the western boundary of the North-East District Council at Gungwe; thence 
generally southwards following the western boundary of the North-East District Council to the 



point where it is intersected by the middle of the main road from Francistown to Palapye at 
Tonota Bridge; thence generally southwards following the middle of the said road from 
Francistown to Palapye to its junction with the direct road from Serule to Mosu at Serule Siding; 
thence following the middle of the direct road from Serule to Mosu to the point of 
commencement. 

BAMANGWATO CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 39) 

   The area of the Bamangwato Tribal Territory as defined under section 2 of the 

Tribal Territories Act which lies east of the Railway Line but excluding the Shashe Controlled 
Hunting Area (No. 12) referred to above. 

NGWAKETSE CONTROLLED HUNTING AREA (NO. 40) 

   Commencing at the intersection of the northern boundary of the Bangwaketse Tribal Territory 
with Longitude 24° 15' 00" east to the beacon of the said Tribal Territory at the intersection of 
Longitude 24° 15' 00" east with the parallel of Latitude passing 25 miles south of the centre of 
Khakhea Pan, thence north-westwards, westwards, northwards and south-eastwards following 
the boundary of the said Tribal Territory to the point of commencement. 

Jwaneng Controlled Hunting Areas 

   (a)   The Jwaneng Township 
   (b)   Mine Lease Area 
   (c)   Tribal land under the Ngwaketse Land Board. 

 


